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Statkraft, Region Nord-Norge.
Contact person: Torstein Elvegård

Governor oil system for Hydro 
Turbine. Oil volume: 5,200 L of 
hydraulic oil. 

The governor oil system was 
suffering from irregular and deviant 
operation caused by resin (oxida-
tion) formation in the valves. The 
resin formation was identified as a 
sticky brown layer on all surfaces in 
the system. Due to resin formation 
valve malfunctions were becoming 
frequent, causing unplanned shut-
downs. 

The consequence of the contami-
nation was that the valves had to be 
removed and cleaned up to 4 times a 
year at a cost of EUR 800 each time. 
The cost of a new valve is EUR 
3,000.

In order to arrest the problems and 
ensure continuous operation a 
CJC  FineFilter HDU 27/54 MZ 
was installed. Two cellulose based 

TMCJC  FilterInserts B 27/27 (3µm 
absolute) were used. 

After just one month of filtration the 
turbine operation has become stable 
and without interruptions.
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